
IMWZADFW7WOK < Doc / New England Medical Monthly Volume 27, No. 6

 

New England Medical Monthly Volume 27, No. 6

Filesize: 9.69 MB

 

Reviews

Extremely helpful for all type of folks. It generally is not going to expense a lot of. I found out this book
from my dad and i advised this book to find out.
(Mela ny Goyette) 

 

DISC L A IM ER      | DM C A 
 

http://www.readnow.site/disclaimer.html
http://www.readnow.site/dmca.html


ZADPJTBIXVE4 \ PDF \\ New England Medical Monthly Volume 27, No. 6

NEW ENGLAND MEDICAL MONTHLY VOLUME 27, NO. 6

To save New Eng la nd Medica l Monthly V olum e 27, No. 6             PDF, remember to follow the web link listed
below and download the ebook or gain access to other information which might be related to NEW ENGLAND
MEDICAL MONTHLY VOLUME 27, NO. 6 book.

Rarebooksclub.com, United States, 2012. Paperback. Book Condition: New. 246 x 189 mm. Language: English .
Brand New Book ***** Print on Demand *****.This historic book may have numerous typos and missing text.
Purchasers can download a free scanned copy of the original book (without typos) from the publisher. Not
indexed. Not illustrated. 1908 Excerpt: .small and apparently inert mass, which had remained unchanged since
July, 1907. This growth was reported to be a mixed sarcoma. Photographs and casts of the condition before
and aEer treatment were shown as well as the exhibition of the patient. The third patient presented was a little
girl, who, when she came under Dr. Abbe s observation, had a tumor which occupied the entire parotid region
extending beneath the jaw, upward to the zygoma and forward on the cheek. It was regarded as an
angiosarcoma. An attempt was made to excise it, but this had to be abandoned on account of its extent,
vascularity and nerve involvement. Application of strong radium in a glass tube was thereupon made. At one
time the tube was pushed into the center of the cavernous angioma and leE over night. This produced great
reaction, high fever and tenderness in the region of the growth. Since then the mas had become flattened so
that it was now scarcely noticeable and apparently nothing remained but the shrunken fibrous remnant of the
huge soEtumor. The next patient was a boy with an extensive tuberculoma of the skin of the hand and foot
which had been unsuccessfully treated for seven years by every possible means, including liquid air. AEer a few
applications of radium the lesions disappeared. One year later, soE, pink, cicatricial skin remained, as
witnessed. The next patient was a man with a round-celled sarcoma of two-thirds of the eyelid, who...
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